HEL . VR e . diwitn/ vo-30 3/ qrEeTT/R003-08

WHEAR, AT 7§, Joou/aEaT ¥, WH 2|9

WRT ATL-F
TERTZ IR W wiafraaiad agm %@ (Wi U, U8-97 snfr
| UH-A i Wig e faa 1 sy gisfafie) o a o

Tz R
HAEE, TFE Yoo o3R, FHTF 8 WA ooy

i
UaE Tt Afafam, 23R,

A% THEAAN. 220 ¥/ HeTR-RY/FUSHHI-R. — TAT3well, TR wre=rw, H=e
Toreeht 7w Fram, 1343 9T QRO SUATEE Gl e et siwer oot
AT A MUY U, HIE TEART AUFEE, %] (RR¥R 7 HAE Iu) grew
HEH L¢3 T GE-FE () = WM TREEeR EntEiiem sweas
e,

T, ST, S ATTAIHTE werw 2y 3 = M- () = T () Ay
() T WaT FoaTe STetedr SATERIRET ST I S S WHe FHIOn=al 56

W TR-T— X ¥ (2¢8)
= vud 3.00]



€L WERTE VTG TATH, 2., WEAT X6, R00W/AT ¥, 7iF Wee  [WRTIRA
T FREHTeT ST e FENTSE YT AN, g et mar fam, 23ud are oarorat
QR ST @Teiter e Wl o — |
2.y Framin Hud fadet m (Sl gurom) Frem, o0k o HEvEE 9.
R e ferdelt v forerm, 2] (AT R e e < A P 7 v oA
Ten amd) Ao Praw 3% A die-Fra (TF), TS (3) FHia ¢ ke TutET wH
7 AT 7 4 AT ¢ kR TG B 67 THeIeH A FAP e
L. .
3. e Framen tam wk wel,—
(2) ute-fram g weiter,—
(37) * ¢ Tutg FH qF THeredT A AL ¢ I2 T FH 77
() die-fram § = wigEnTdeT ¢ ¢¢ TugT FE AG Ao oA
TFTTASAT ¢ IR TG HH T THEA I TALR erv{el HIET.
® qﬁ?—ﬁm(?)mﬂﬁ“aaaﬁgﬁwm"mnmﬁwﬁ
« 3¢ Il FE S AT ST WIS A .
. T P fa we wde de-Rem (TF) @ () = wgwde
Q¢ TR Y T TR * AT AP ** R T HH T AT I
. T frgarer Pt wo-E Wil —
(2) tre-Pram (1) W kR Sig Y @@ Aweedr o HSREt
« 3u, TR E FT FGAT IR HAER A HEL
() Gre-Prm () T ¢ k8 FStIET wH oA THCER A AAGIEA
 Qu, g s oF FFEEET S HOE SR .

(3) trz-Prm (3) Aefier ¢ R% ANl F wE AOEEd A A
« 3, e T T FEETIT S W S S



\
WRT UR-A]  WETTE VIR IACH, AL, WEAT 3%, R00W/HRAT 8, I 2qe <oL
% e Pramra fam vo-uw mt,—
(7) wre-fram () mdier < 180 aw mnﬁwﬁaﬁ “ UhEw 99 T
AR TS T
(3) de-frem (3) wefier «* werelre o " A AeTTdEett ¢ Ru a7 e TR
AT FRTE
o, ey et fe wo- it mefiet die-frgm (1) med ¢ 2 it st A
ARG ¢}t AT T ST AT SR H

HERTGTS T e SRAER § W,

. At e,
AT 39 s,



€CR  TENTE VT {9TCA, HL., WEAT 18, Yoo/ v, ¥ wye  [wrT SR

HOME DEPARTMENT
Mantralaya, Mumbai 400 032, dated 26th September 2005

NOTIFICATION

BoMBAY PROHIBITION AcT, 1949,

No. FLR. 1104/CR-21/EXC-2.— Whereas the Government of
Maharashtra considers that the following rules further to amend
the Bombay Foreign Liquor Rules, 1953, should be brought into
force at once, and therefore, the rule should be made without
previous publication as provided by the proviso to sub-section
(3) of section 143 of the Bombay Prohibition Act, 1949 (Bom. XXV
of 1949) ;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clauses
(b) and (k) of sub-section (2) of section 143 of the Bombay
Prohibition Act, 1949 (Bom. XXV of 1949) and of all other powers
enabling it in that behalf, the Government- of Maharashtra
hereby makes the following rules, further to amend the Bombay
Foreign Liquor Rules, 1953, namely :—

1. These rules may be called the Bombay Foreign Liquor
(Fourth Amendment) Rules, 2005.

2. In rule 32 of the Bombay Foreign Liquor Rules, 1953
(hereinafter referred to as “the principal rules”), in sub-rule (i),
in clause (d), for the figure and word “ 18 years ” the figure and
word “21 years” ghall be substituted.

3. In rule 52 of the principal rules—
(i) in sub-rule (1),—

(@) for the figure and word “18 years” the figure and
word “ 21 years” shall be substituted.

(b) in the proviso to sub-rule (1), for the figure and word
“18 years” the figure and word “21 years” shall be -
substituted. ‘

(ii) in sub-rule (2), for the figure and word “ 18 years” the
figure and word “21 years” shall be substituted.



W O] WERTE VT (G0N, 39T, FUAT 3%, Roou/AET ¥, TR 9’38 <%0

4. In rule 57 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (1), in the
proviso, to clause (a), for the figure and word “18 years” the
figure and word “21 years” shall be substituted.

5. In rule 70-D of the principal rules,—

(0} in sub-rule (1), for the figure and word “21 years” the
figure and word “25 years” shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-rule (2), for the figure “21 years ” the figure and
word “25 years” shall be substituted.

(fii} in sub-rule (3), for the figure “21 years” the figure and
word “25 years” shall be substituted.

6. In rule 70-F of the principal rules,—

(@) in sub-rule (1), for the words “eighteen years ” the figure
and word “21 years” shall be substituted.

(ii) in sub-rule (8), for the words “twenty-one years” the
figure and word “25 years” shall be substituted.

7. In rule 70-G of the principal rules, in sub-rule (1), for the -
words “ twenty-one years ” the figure and word “ 25 years” shall
be substituted.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

G. J. RASAL,
Deputy Secretary to Government.

IR et e, gad



